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MARSHALL, C.J. 
Marriage is a vital social institution. The exclusive commitment of two individuals to each other
nurtures love and mutual support; it brings stability to our society. For those who choose to
marry, and for their children, marriage provides an abundance of legal, financial, and social
benefits. In return it imposes weighty legal, financial, and social obligations. The question before
us is whether, consistent with the Massachusetts Constitution, the Commonwealth may deny the
protections, benefits, and obligations conferred by civil marriage to two individuals of the same
sex who wish to marry. We conclude that it may not. The Massachusetts Constitution affirms the
dignity and equality of all individuals. It forbids the creation of second-class citizens. In reaching
our conclusion we have given full deference to the arguments made by the Commonwealth. But
it has failed to identify any constitutionally adequate reason for denying civil marriage to
same-sex couples.

We are mindful that our decision marks a change in the history of our marriage law. Many people
hold deep-seated religious, moral, and ethical convictions that marriage should be limited to the
union of one man and one woman, and that homosexual conduct is immoral. Many hold equally
strong religious, moral, and ethical convictions that same-sex couples are entitled to be married,
and that homosexual persons should be treated no differently than their heterosexual neighbors.
Neither view answers the question before us. Our concern is with the Massachusetts Constitution
as a charter of governance for every person properly within its reach. "Our obligation is to define
the liberty of all, not to mandate our own moral code." Lawrence v. Texas (2003), quoting
Planned Parenthood of Southeastern Pa. v. Casey (1992) . . . 

The plaintiffs' claim that the marriage restriction violates the Massachusetts Constitution can be
analyzed in two ways. Does it offend the Constitution's guarantees of equality before the law? Or
do the liberty and due process provisions of the Massachusetts Constitution secure the plaintiffs'
right to marry their chosen partner?

We begin by considering the nature of civil marriage itself. Simply put, the government creates
civil marriage. In Massachusetts, civil marriage is, and since pre-Colonial days has been,
precisely what its name implies: a wholly secular institution. See Commonwealth v. Munson,
127 Mass. 459, 460-466 (1879) (noting that "[i]n Massachusetts, from very early times, the
requisites of a valid marriage have been regulated by statutes of the Colony, Province, and
Commonwealth," and surveying marriage statutes from 1639 through 1834). No religious
ceremony has ever been required to validate a Massachusetts marriage. Id.

In a real sense, there are three partners to every civil marriage: two willing spouses and an
approving State. See DeMatteo v. DeMatteo (2002) ("Marriage is not a mere contract between
two parties but a legal status from which certain rights and obligations arise"); Smith v. Smith,
(1898) (on marriage, the parties "assume[] new relations to each other and to the State"). 



The benefits accessible only by way of a marriage license are enormous, touching nearly every
aspect of life and death. The department states that "hundreds of statutes" are related to marriage
and to marital benefits . . . 

It is undoubtedly for these concrete reasons, as well as for its intimately personal significance,
that civil marriage has long been termed a "civil right." See, e.g., Loving v. Virginia (1967)
("Marriage is one of the 'basic civil rights of man,' fundamental to our very existence and
survival") . . . The United States Supreme Court has described the right to marry as "of
fundamental importance for all individuals" and as "part of the fundamental 'right of privacy'
implicit in the Fourteenth Amendment's Due Process Clause." Zablocki v. Redhail (1978). See
Loving v. Virginia, supra ("The freedom to marry has long been recognized as one of the vital
personal rights essential to the orderly pursuit of happiness by free men").

The Massachusetts Constitution requires, at a minimum, that the exercise of the State's regulatory
authority not be "arbitrary or capricious." Commonwealth v. Henry's Drywall Co.(1974). Under
both the equality and liberty guarantees, regulatory authority must, at very least, serve "a
legitimate purpose in a rational way"; a statute must "bear a reasonable relation to a permissible
legislative objective." 

The department argues that no fundamental right or "suspect" class is at issue here, and rational
basis is the appropriate standard of review. For the reasons we explain below, we conclude that
the marriage ban does not meet the rational basis test for either due process or equal protection.
Because the statute does not survive rational basis review, we do not consider the plaintiffs'
arguments that this case merits strict judicial scrutiny.

The department posits three legislative rationales for prohibiting same-sex couples from
marrying: (1) providing a "favorable setting for procreation"; (2) ensuring the optimal setting for
child rearing, which the department defines as "a two-parent family with one parent of each sex";
and (3) preserving scarce State and private financial resources. We consider each in turn.

The judge in the Superior Court endorsed the first rationale, holding that "the state's interest in
regulating marriage is based on the traditional concept that marriage's primary purpose is
procreation." This is incorrect. Our laws of civil marriage do not privilege procreative
heterosexual intercourse between married people above every other form of adult intimacy and
every other means of creating a family . . . Fertility is not a condition of marriage, nor is it
grounds for divorce. People who have never consummated their marriage, and never plan to, may
be and stay married . . . People who cannot stir from their deathbed may marry.

The department's first stated rationale, equating marriage with unassisted heterosexual
procreation, shades imperceptibly into its second: that confining marriage to opposite-sex
couples ensures that children are raised in the "optimal" setting. Protecting the welfare of
children is a paramount State policy. Restricting marriage to opposite-sex couples, however,
cannot plausibly further this policy. "The demographic changes of the past century make it
difficult to speak of an average American family” . . . 



Given the wide range of public benefits reserved only for married couples, we do not credit the
department's contention that the absence of access to civil marriage amounts to little more than
an inconvenience to same-sex couples and their children. Excluding same-sex couples from civil
marriage will not make children of opposite-sex marriages more secure, but it does prevent
children of same-sex couples from enjoying the immeasurable advantages that flow from the
assurance of "a stable family structure in which children will be reared, educated, and
socialized." 

The third rationale advanced by the department is that limiting marriage to opposite-sex couples
furthers the Legislature's interest in conserving scarce State and private financial resources. The
marriage restriction is rational, it argues, because the General Court logically could assume that
same-sex couples are more financially independent than married couples and thus less needy of
public marital benefits, such as tax advantages, or private marital benefits, such as
employer-financed health plans that include spouses in their coverage.

An absolute statutory ban on same-sex marriage bears no rational relationship to the goal of
economy. First, the department's conclusory generalization -- that same-sex couples are less
financially dependent on each other than opposite-sex couples -- ignores that many same-sex
couples, such as many of the plaintiffs in this case, have children and other dependents (here,
aged parents) in their care.The department does not contend, nor could it, that these dependents
are less needy or deserving than the dependents of married couples. Second, Massachusetts
marriage laws do not condition receipt of public and private financial benefits to married
individuals on a demonstration of financial dependence on each other; the benefits are available
to married couples regardless of whether they mingle their finances or actually depend on each
other for support.

GREANEY, J. (concurring). 
I agree with the result reached by the court, the remedy ordered, and much of the reasoning in the
court's opinion. In my view, however, the case is more directly resolved using traditional equal
protection analysis.

(a) Article 1 of the Declaration of Rights, as amended by art. 106 of the Amendments to the
Massachusetts Constitution, provides:

"All people are born free and equal and have certain natural, essential and unalienable rights;
among which may be reckoned the right of enjoying and defending their lives and liberties; that
of acquiring, possessing and protecting property; in fine, that of seeking and obtaining their
safety and happiness. Equality under the law shall not be denied or abridged because of sex, race,
color, creed or national origin."

This provision, even prior to its amendment, guaranteed to all people in the Commonwealth --
equally -- the enjoyment of rights that are deemed important or fundamental. The withholding of
relief from the plaintiffs, who wish to marry, and are otherwise eligible to marry, on the ground
that the couples are of the same gender, constitutes a categorical restriction of a fundamental
right. The restriction creates a straightforward case of discrimination that disqualifies an entire



group of our citizens and their families from participation in an institution of paramount legal
and social importance. This is impermissible under art. 1. 

SPINA, J. (dissenting, with whom Sosman and Cordy, JJ., join). 
What is at stake in this case is not the unequal treatment of individuals or whether individual
rights have been impermissibly burdened, but the power of the Legislature to effectuate social
change without interference from the courts, pursuant to art. 30 of the Massachusetts Declaration
of Rights. The power to regulate marriage lies with the Legislature, not with the judiciary. Today,
the court has transformed its role as protector of individual rights into the role of creator of
rights, and I respectfully dissent . . . 

The court has extruded a new right from principles of substantive due process, and in doing so it
has distorted the meaning and purpose of due process. The purpose of substantive due process is
to protect existing rights, not to create new rights. Its aim is to thwart government intrusion, not
invite it. The court asserts that the Massachusetts Declaration of Rights serves to guard against
government intrusion into each individual's sphere of privacy. Similarly, the Supreme Court has
called for increased due process protection when individual privacy and intimacy are threatened
by unnecessary government imposition . . . These cases . . . focus on the threat to privacy when
government seeks to regulate the most intimate activity behind bedroom doors. The statute in
question does not seek to regulate intimate activity within an intimate relationship, but merely
gives formal recognition to a particular marriage. The State has respected the private lives of the
plaintiffs, and has done nothing to intrude in the relationships that each of the plaintiff couples
enjoy . . . Ironically, by extending the marriage laws to same-sex couples the court has turned
substantive due process on its head and used it to interject government into the plaintiffs’ lives.

SOSMAN, J. (dissenting, with whom Spina and Cordy, JJ., join). 
In applying the rational basis test to any challenged statutory scheme, the issue is not whether the
Legislature's rationale behind that scheme is persuasive to us, but only whether it satisfies a
minimal threshold of rationality. Today, rather than apply that test, the court announces that,
because it is persuaded that there are no differences between same-sex and opposite-sex couples,
the Legislature has no rational basis for treating them differently with respect to the granting of
marriage licenses. Reduced to its essence, the court's opinion concludes that, because same-sex
couples are now raising children, and withholding the benefits of civil marriage from their union
makes it harder for them to raise those children, the State must therefore provide the benefits of
civil marriage to same-sex couples just as it does to opposite-sex couples. Of course, many
people are raising children outside the confines of traditional marriage, and, by definition, those
children are being deprived of the various benefits that would flow if they were being raised in a
household with married parents. That does not mean that the Legislature must accord the full
benefits of marital status on every household raising children. Rather, the Legislature need only
have some rational basis for concluding that, at present, those alternate family structures have not
yet been conclusively shown to be the equivalent of the marital family structure that has
established itself as a successful one over a period of centuries.



CORDY, J. (dissenting, with whom Spina and Sosman, JJ., join). 
The court's opinion concludes that the Department of Public Health has failed to identify any
"constitutionally adequate reason" for limiting civil marriage to opposite-sex unions, and that
there is no "reasonable relationship" between a disqualification of same-sex couples who wish to
enter into a civil marriage and the protection of public health, safety, or general welfare.
Consequently, it holds that the marriage statute cannot withstand scrutiny under the
Massachusetts Constitution. Because I find these conclusions to be unsupportable in light of the
nature of the rights and regulations at issue, the presumption of constitutional validity and
significant deference afforded to legislative enactments, and the "undesirability of the judiciary
substituting its notions of correct policy for that of a popularly elected Legislature" responsible
for making such policy, I respectfully dissent. Although it may be desirable for many reasons to
extend to same-sex couples the benefits and burdens of civil marriage (and the plaintiffs have
made a powerfully reasoned case for that extension), that decision must be made by the
Legislature, not the court.

While the institution of marriage is deeply rooted in the history and traditions of our country and
our State, the right to marry someone of the same sex is not. No matter how personal or intimate
a decision to marry someone of the same sex might be, the right to make it is not guaranteed by
the right of personal autonomy.

The protected right to freedom of association, in the sense of freedom of choice "to enter into and
maintain certain intimate human relationships," Roberts v. United States Jaycees (1984) . . . is
similarly limited and unimpaired by the marriage statute. As recognized by the Supreme Court,
that right affords protection only to "certain kinds of highly personal relationships," such as those
between husband and wife, parent and child, and among close relatives, that "have played a
critical role in the culture and traditions of the Nation," and are "deeply rooted in this Nation's
history and tradition." Moore v. East Cleveland ,(1977) (distinguishing on this basis between
family and nonfamily relationships). Unlike opposite-sex marriages, which have deep historic
roots, or the parent-child relationship, which reflects a "strong tradition" founded on "the history
and culture of Western civilization" and "is now established beyond debate as an enduring
American tradition," Wisconsin v. Yoder (1972); or extended family relationships, which have
been "honored throughout our history," Moore v. East Cleveland, same-sex relationships,
although becoming more accepted, are certainly not so "deeply rooted in this Nation's history and
tradition" as to warrant such enhanced constitutional protection.


